

Line #	1" Inch Crusher Run Rock			Armstrong Rentals, LLC		Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc.		Southwest Gravel Products LLC		Westover Rock & Sand, Inc.	
	Description	Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 1 HWY 33 MP 3 DORCHESTER	750	TN	\$ 23.75	\$ 17,812.50	\$ 25.75	\$ 19,312.50	\$ 23.70	\$ 17,775.00	\$ 24.95	\$ 18,712.50
2	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 FREMONT MAINT YARD	500	TN	\$ 23.22	\$ 11,610.00	\$ 21.80	\$ 10,900.00		\$ -	\$ 20.90	\$ 10,450.00
3	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 BLAIR MAINT YARD	500	TN	\$ 22.84	\$ 11,420.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$ -	\$ 18.95	\$ 9,475.00
4	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 MORMON BRIDGE YARD	500	TN	\$ 22.41	\$ 11,205.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$ -	\$ 19.45	\$ 9,725.00
5	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 SOUTH OMAHA MAINT YARD	500	TN	\$ 21.53	\$ 10,765.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$ -	\$ 20.50	\$ 10,250.00
6	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 OMAHA 108TH MAINT YARD	500	TN	\$ 21.53	\$ 10,765.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$ -	\$ 20.20	\$ 10,100.00
7	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 ELKHORN MAINT YARD	500	TN	\$ 22.48	\$ 11,240.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$ -	\$ 20.50	\$ 10,250.00
8	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 MELIA HILL GRETNA MAINT YRD	500	TN	\$ 19.34	\$ 9,670.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$ -	\$ 18.95	\$ 9,475.00
9	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 PLATTSMOUTH MAINT YARD	500	TN	\$ 20.14	\$ 10,070.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.98	\$ 8,990.00	\$ 18.95	\$ 9,475.00
10	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 2 MANLEY MAINT	500	TN	\$ 16.89	\$ 8,445.00	No Bid	No Bid		\$ -	\$ 17.60	\$ 8,800.00
11	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 6 ANSLEY SITE HWY 2 # 89.5	300	TN	\$ 48.40	\$ 14,520.00	\$ 40.20	\$ 12,060.00	\$ 36.91	\$ 11,073.00	\$ 43.45	\$ 13,035.00
12	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 6 ARNOLD SITE HWY 92 # 251	300	TN	\$ 56.78	\$ 17,034.00	\$ 45.85	\$ 13,755.00	\$ 41.95	\$ 12,585.00	\$ 49.95	\$ 14,985.00
13	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 6 OCONTO SITE HWY 21 #52.3	300	TN	\$ 50.58	\$ 15,174.00	\$ 43.33	\$ 12,999.00	\$ 38.96	\$ 11,688.00	\$ 44.95	\$ 13,485.00
14	1" CRUSHER RUN ROCK DIST 6 SITE 605 HWY 2 RP 184	500	TN	\$ 72.32	\$ 36,160.00	\$ 52.08	\$ 26,040.00	\$ 46.26	\$ 23,130.00	No Bid	\$ -
15	PRICE PER TON MILE FOR ADD/ALT DELIVERY LOCATIONS	200	TN	\$ 0.16	\$ 32.00	\$ 0.16	\$ 32.00	\$ 0.14	\$ 28.00	\$ 0.16	\$ 32.00
Total					\$195,922.50		\$ 95,098.50		\$ 85,269.00		\$148,249.50
Payment Terms				0 30		net 30		0 30			
Delivery Days ARO				14-21				21		as ordered	
Comments											